


The reservoir path is consistently 2 metres wide 
and surfaced.  There are minimal steep gradients. 
There are no gates, steps or stiles on the route, 
except for roadside kerbs at points 3 and 4 
(between 5 and 10cm high). The steps out of the 
car park can currently be avoided by entering the 
pavement via the entrance gate – please take 
extra care as this is also the vehicular entrance.

From the car park (point 1), exit via the steps or 
if required exit carefully via the entrance 
gateway – please take extra care as this is also a 
vehicular entrance. Turn left onto the pavement 
and continue for 100 metres until you reach the 
entrance to Yorkshire Water’s permissive 
footpath on your left. 

The path takes you along the northern shore of 
the reservoir, through sections of mixed 
woodland and with glimpses across the water. 
Continue for about 1km to point 2, where the 
path meets a road. 

Turn left (please take care for the short section 
where there is no pavement) and cross Baitings 
Viaduct. You will soon reach the entrance to 
Yorkshire Water’s permissive footpath along the 
southern shore of the reservoir (point 3). 

Enter the permissive path and continue 
eastwards with the water on your left until you 
reach the path across the embankment at point 
4. Turn left here for the final section of the route 
back to the car park (point 1). This section of the 
walk provides an excellent vantage point to look 
across Baitings Reservoir on your left and down 
the valley to Ryburn Reservoir on your right.


